Custodial Supplies 2024/2025 SY
Cohoes City School District- Hill & Markes

Miscellaneous Supplies Description Stock # Price (Each) (p:)rncc;e) Case# on Pallet  |Price (per pallet)
Eraser Sponges
Easy Erasing Sponge Pad, 4.5 L x 2.8W x 1.25, 60/cs
MMM59031 1.07 64.2
Medium Duty Scrub Sponge, dual action green cleaning
pad/yellow sponge, 3.6x6.1x0.7 20/per cs MMM20688 1.66 33.4
Medium Duty Scouring Pad, 9 Inch L x 6 Inch W, Nylon, Green;
6/Pack, 10 Pack/Case
DSCMD69 0.34 16.75
Wypall X60 Wipers Workhorse Manufactured Rags
White Color, Size 12.5' X 16.8" or Equal  Quantity - 252 per Box KIM54015 0.1 24.63 154 3880.8
Micro Fiber Cloths TUWMFB74, 746,
16 X 16, Color: Red, Blue, Green 74R SOLD 24/CS
Quantity - 12 per pack/ 15 packs per case ONLY @ 19.92 0.83 149 .4
Kraft Waxed Femine Hygiene Sani-Bag
Quantity - 500 per Case HSP260 0.04 18.86
Dust Mop Handles
Wooden, 54" Length
Quantity - 12 per Case TUWSNH60 12.34 148.08
Rags
reclaimed special knit T-shirt rage, cotton, white 25#/cs HSP34025 1.71 42.84
. . . ] _ CLX15949 SOLD
Dllsmfe"ctmf Cleanmg Wipes, Clorox, 75 ct. Canister, Fresh Scent, 6/75/CS ONLY @
Size: 7" x 8" no substitutes 33.35 564 33.35
Disinfecting Cleaning Wipes, Clorox, 2 pack/700 ct Refill, Fresh
Scent, no substitutes CLX31428 29.99 59.98
Foam Hand Soap, NCL Afia Ocean Mist no substitutes 6/1000miL/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Facilipro Nexa Waterless Foam Hand Sanitizer 2/1200 ML per
case, no substitutes EC06102064 23 46 156 7176
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